
Causeway, Outreach Facility & Covington FFE - St. Tammany Parish Library

St. Tammany Parish, LA
Corrected 7/2/2024

Library Interiors
Southern Interior 

Solutions

ESTEY - Steel Shelving
Causeway Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

Shelving Total $1,782.00 NO BID

ARCHITECTURAL WOODWORK

Causeway Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

Architectural Woodwork Total $38,670.52 NO BID

3BRANCH

Causeway Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

3BRANCH Total $4,129.92 NO BID

AGATI

Causeway Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

Covington Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

AGATI TOTAL $40,378.98 $40,077.00

ARCADIA

Causeway Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

Arcadia Total $8,912.79 $7,908.00

CAROLINA

Causeway Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

Carolina Total $4,341.87 $3,394.00

GLOBAL

Outreach Facility Tag Quantity Subtotal Subtotal

Global Total NO BID $1,906.00

HIGHTOWER

Causeway Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

Hightower Total $4,199.29 NO BID

LELAND/FRESH COAST

Causeway Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

Leland Furniture Total $7,210.57 $7,212.00

NATIONAL

Causeway Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

National Total NO BID $1,543.00

BID TAB RESULTS - June 26, 2024



PALMIERI - Browsing Bins

Causeway Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

Palmieri Total $2,080.17 NO BID

SOUTHERN ALUMINUM

Causeway Tag Quantity Unit Subtotal Subtotal

Smith Systems Total $7,496.22 NO BID

Library Interiors

Southern Interior 

Solutions

AWARD AWARD

$65,568.69 $54,828.00


